
CITY OF FAIRFIELD 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 2020-64 
 
 

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FAIRFIELD APPROVING 

THE AGREEMENT FOR THE PROVISION OF FIXED-ROUTE AND PARATRANSIT 

SERVICE BY AND BETWEEN CITY OF FAIRFIELD AND MV TRANSPORTATION, 

INC.  
 

 

WHEREAS, Fairfield and Suisun Transit (FAST) provides safe, reliable, and high-quality 
public transportation; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Fairfield contracts with private businesses to provide the day to 
day operations of FAST; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Fairfield’s current contract for transit operations services will 
expire on June 30, 2020; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Fairfield issued a Request for Proposals, RFP 2019-001 on 
August 21, 2019, to solicit proposals to provide transit operations services from July 1, 
2020, to June 30, 2024, with an option for the City to approve up to three one-year 
extensions; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Fairfield received three proposals and determined that two 
proposals were responsible and responsive; and 
 
WHEREAS, an Evaluation Committee used the “Best Value” process from Federal 
Transit Administration Circular 4220.1F to evaluate the proposals on the criteria set forth 
in RFP 2019-001; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Evaluation Committee determined the proposal from MV Transportation, 
Inc., provides the “Best Value”, and recommends MV Transportation, Inc. be awarded a 
contract for transit operations services to commence on July 1, 2020. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FAIRFIELD HEREBY 

RESOLVES: 

 
Section 1. The above recitals are true and correct and are a substantive part of this 
resolution. 
 
Section 2. The City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to execute the 
Agreement between the City of Fairfield and MV Transportation for the Provision of Fixed-
Route and Paratransit Service (“Agreement”) substantially in the form attached hereto as 
“Exhibit A” for a cost not to exceed $6,306,227.01 for Fiscal Year 2020/2021, a cost not 
to exceed $6,317,316.40 for Fiscal Year 2021/2022, a cost not to exceed $6,437,912.47 
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for Fiscal Year 2022/2023,  and a cost not to exceed $6,558,493.75 for Fiscal Year 
2023/2024. 
 
Section 3. The City Manager is further authorized to approve up to three one-year 
extensions as contemplated by the terms of the Agreement. 
 
Section 4. The City Manager is further authorized to enter into a Memorandum of 
Understanding with MV Transportation to suspend, waive, or otherwise modify service 
levels identified in the Agreement, with the advice of the City Attorney, if such action is 
deemed necessary to protect public health and safety related to the COVID-19 
emergency and its aftermath and such actions do not materially increase the City’s 
obligations or materially reduce its rights under the Agreement. 
 

Section 5. The City Manager and City Attorney are hereby authorized to approve minor 
changes to the contract as are necessary for successful implementation, provided that 
such changes do not materially increase the City’s obligations or materially reduce its 
rights under the contract. 
 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 19th day of May, 2020, by the following vote: 
 
AYES: COUNCILMEMBERS:  PRICE / BERTANI / MOY / TIMM / VACCARO  
 
NOES: COUNCILMEMBERS:          
 
ABSENT: COUNCILMEMBERS:          
 
ABSTAIN: COUNCILMEMBERS:          
 
 
          
          MAYOR 
ATTEST: 
 
 

       
CITY CLERK 


